Florencie U. Patton, Principal Buyer
Phone: (205) 714-3747

Email: underwoodf@jccal.org
Harriett Bell, Buyer

Phone: (205) 325-8702

Email: bellh@jccal.org

BID TABULATION
ITB 70-20
JANITORIAL AND SPECIALTY PRODUCTS

A. Johnson Showplace Floor Finish #4061 or approved equal. Showplace Floor Finish - A high gloss, metal-complexed synthetic polymer floor finish with exceptional durability under heavy foot traffic conditions. It
shall possess outstanding water and detergent resistance. It shall be suitable for use on all floors except unsealed wood or cork. It shall possess excellent adhesion properties and be tolerant of misuse. It shall possess

excellent abrasion resistance and oil resistance.

1 2 3 4
BUDGET JANITORIAL GREEN VISION &
GBMS, INC. SUPPLY INC. ASSOCIATES, LLC AMERICAN OSMENT
QTY uoMm PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT.PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE
220 CS $ 89.00| $ 19,580.00| $ 37.00{ $ 8,140.00| $ 70.00( $ 15,400.00| $ 68.00 $ 14,960.00| $ 72701 $ 15994.00| $ 160.00| $ 35,200.00
Diversey, Inc. & . Essential Industries, Pureshine . . Johnson Showplace Floor
Manufacturer Name & Product Number 4CBD540458 Betco Hybrid G-1 25, ESS 215 FF: 4/1 Gal, Case Johnson Vectra 5 Gal. Diversey Amplify #4385110 Finish 4061

B. Revive Ultra Speed Cleaner/Restore #04636

or approved equal. Concentrated cleaner and finish combination. Formulated to clean and shine UHS finishes in one step. Clean floor and shine provided without using
achieves a smoother, deeper gloss when burnished. Can b

a mop-on restorer or rinsing. Fills in surface scratches and scuffs so that finish

e used with an auto scrubber or mop.

1 2 3 4
BUDGET JANITORIAL GREEN VISION &
GBMS, INC. SUPPLY INC. ASSOCIATES, LLC AMERICAN OSMENT
QTY UOM PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT.PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE
80 CS $ 17.00{ $ 1,360.00( $ 43101 $ 3,448.00| $ 45.78| $ 3,66240|$ 65.29]| $ 5,223.20| $ 59.15( $ 4,732.00| $ 100.00| $ 8,000.00
Diversev. Inc. & Revive Non-Stop Essential Industries, Citrus
Manufacturer Name & Product Number ¥ InC. Cleaner/Restorer-5 Gallon | Scrub & Shine, ESS-525 FR; 5 Revive 04636 Diversey Revive #904636 5-Gal. Envirobox
#CBD540441 .
Container Gal./Bucket
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Florencie U. Patton, Principal Buyer BID TABULATION

Phone: (205) 714-3747
Email: underwoodf@jccal.org ITB 70-20

Harriett Bell, Buyer JANITORIAL AND SPECIALTY PRODUCTS

Phone: (205) 325-8702
Email: bellh@jccal.org

C. Stride Liquid Neutral Cleaner, Johnson Stride Cleaner #3906 or approved equal. Super concentrated liquid neutral cleaner for use on any washable surface. Blend of low foaming surfactants, leave with neutral
ph., does not require rinsing. Dries film free, leaves no dulling residues. Does not contain phosphates. Furnished in one type and grade only. Intended for removing soil and other extraneous material from washable hard

surfaces.
1 2 3 4 5 6
BUDGET JANITORIAL GREEN VISION &
GBMS, INC. SUPPLY INC. ASSOCIATES, LLC AMERICAN OSMENT
QTY UOM PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT.PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE
290 CS $ 80.00( $ 23,200.00| $ 24701 $ 7,163.00| $ 37.60( $ 10,904.00|$ 27.50| $ 7,975.00 | $ 25.20( $ 7,308.00( $ 120.00( $ 34,800.00
. Essential Industries, Nu-tral . Lo
Manufacturer Name & Product Number Diversey, Inc. & Betco PH?TS Gallon Cleaner, ESS-507FC; 5 Gal Stride 3906 Diversey Stride #903906 Stide Liquid N.eutral Cleaner,
#CBD540441 Container Bucket Johnson Stride Cleaner
D. Bravo Liquid Wax Stripper, Johnson Bravo Stripper #04576 or approved equal. Concentrated liquid wax stripper formulated to penetrate old and dirty metal. Complex polymer emulsion finishes permitting
removal by mop or scrubbing machine. Suitable for use on and not harmful to most types of hard, resilient flooring, non-ammoniated, biodegradable, and phosphate-free.

2 1 3 4 5 6
BUDGET JANITORIAL GREEN VISION &
GBMS, INC. SUPPLY INC. ASSOCIATES, LLC AMERICAN OSMENT
QTY UOM PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT.PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE
350 CS $ 17.00({ $ 5,950.00| $ 34701 $ 12,145.00| $ 7096| $ 24,836.00($ 41.00($ 14350.00| $ 37.25($ 13,03750| $ 100.00] $ 35,000.00

Essential Industries,

Manufacturer Name & Product Number Diversey, Inc. & Bravo Strlppgr-S Gallon Annihilator C-G, ESS-2913 Bravo Stripper 04576 Dlve_rsey BravoHD-LO Bravo Liquid Wax S_trlpper,
#CBD540441 Container ] Stripper #95115958 Johnson Bravo Stripper
FX; 5 Gal. Bucket
GROUP I TOTAL Purchasing Totals| $ 50,090.00| $ 30,896.00( $ 54,802.40| $ 42,508.20( $ 41,071.50| $ 113,000.00
(ITEMS A-D) -
Bidder's Totals| $ 50,090.00| $ 30,896.00( $ 54,802.40| $ 38,769.20( $ 41,071.50| $ 113,000.00
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Florencie U. Patton, Principal Buyer
Phone: (205) 714-3747

Email: underwoodf@jccal.org
Harriett Bell, Buyer

Phone: (205) 325-8702

Email: bellh@jccal.org

BID TABULATION
ITB 70-20
JANITORIAL AND SPECIALTY PRODUCTS

A. Crew toilet bowl cleaner, Johnson Crew #4578 or approved equal. Must remove rust, stains, lime and scale, hard water deposits, uric acids salts. Ability to cling to vertical surfaces EPA registered disinfectant
effective against Staphylococcus aureus and Salmonella Choleraesuis. Kills HIV-1 (Aids Virus) Color changing from green to blue indicates germ killing agents are functioning. Corrosion inhibitor provides extra
protection for pipes, traps and drains. Fragrance: Floral.

1 2 3 4
BUDGET JANITORIAL GREEN VISION &
GBMS, INC. SUPPLY INC. ASSOCIATES, LLC AMERICAN OSMENT

QTY UoM PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE
300 CS $ 3.00] $ 900.00( $ 17.04[ $ 5,112.00| $ 33.84| $ 10,152.00| $ 18.75[ $ 5,625.00| $ 2375 $ 7,125.00({ $ 100.00( $ 30,000.00

Essential Industries, Clinging Crew Toilet Bowl Cleaner

Manufacturer Name & Product Number Uline & #S-19372 Betco Bolmaid 12/32 Oz. Bowl Cleaner, ESS-2841RR; | Spartan NABC 12/32 oz. Diversey Crew #04578 '

12 Otr. Case Johnson Crew

B. Toilet brush, nylon bristles, 16-17” plastic h

andle, Rubbermaid #6310 or approved equal. Nylon Bristles, 16-17” plastic handle,

Scratch resistant.

1 2 3 4
BUDGET JANITORIAL GREEN VISION &
GBMS, INC. SUPPLY INC. ASSOCIATES, LLC AMERICAN OSMENT
QTY UoOM PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT.PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE
1000 CS $ 550 $ 5,500.00| $ 14.40| $ 14,400.00| $ 3.16( $ 3,160.00| $ 21.36] $ 21,360.00| $ 2136 $ 21,360.00] $ 50.00| $ 50,000.00
Manufacturer Name & Product Number Rubbermaid & #S-18650 Rubbermaid 6310-280211 Rubber Maid #6310; 1 Ea Rubbermaid 6310 24/cs Rubbermaid #6310 (Packed | Toilet Br,L,JSh’ Nylon Bristles,
Brush 24/Case) 16-17" Plastic Handle
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Florencie U. Patton, Principal Buyer BID TABULATION

Phone: (205) 714-3747

Email: underwoodf@jccal.org ITB 70-20

Harriett Bell, Buyer JANITORIAL AND SPECIALTY PRODUCTS
Phone: (205) 325-8702

Email: bellh@jccal.org

C. Toilet brush, yarn head, Impact #200 or approved equal. Yarn head w/12” plastic handle.

1 2 3 4 5 6
BUDGET JANITORIAL GREEN VISION &
GBME, INC. SUPPLY INC. ASSOCIATES, LLC AMERICAN OSMENT

QTY UoM PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT.PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE

900 CS $ 18.00( $ 16,200.00| $ 62.00| $ 55,800.00| $ 0.89] $ 801.00($ 73.00[ $ 65,700.00| $ 69.00/ $ 62,100.00] $ 30.00( $ 27,000.00
Colgate-Palmolive Co. & Imp #200-280412 Pk 100 . Impact #200 (Packed .

Manufacturer Name & Product Number 4802970120000 Case Inpact, #200; 1 Ea Brush Impact 200 100/cs 100/Case) Toilet Brush, Yarn Head
GROUP 11 TOTAL Purchasing Totals| $ 22,600.00| $ 75,312.00( $ 14,113.00 | $ 92,685.00( $ 90,585.00| $ 107,000.00
Bidder's Totals 22,600.00 75,312.00 14,113.00 92,685.00 90,585.00| $ 107,000.00

A. Germicidal Spray Cleaner, BETCO-GLYBET Il #BET-08623 or approved equal. Non-scratching germicidal aerosol spray-foam or RTU liquid. Dissolves scum and soap film fast on sink fixtures and other
washable surfaces. No rinsing required, disinfects, won’t scratch or dull surfaces.

1 2 3 4
BUDGET JANITORIAL GREEN VISION &
GBMS, INC. SUPPLY INC. ASSOCIATES, LLC e
QTY UoM PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT.PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE
500 CS $ 350($ 1,750.00| $ 23.88 $ 11,940.00| $ 2448 $ 12,240.00( $ 31.00( $ 15500.00| $ 46.65| $ 23,325.001 $ 80.00] $ 40,000.00
Essential Industries, Diversey Envy Foaming .
Manufacturer Name & Product Number ULINE & #S-19373 Betcha 08623-4103 Readiquatt, ESS-733 DN; 6 . _Spartan TNT Foam Disinfectant Cleaner #04531 Germicidal Spray Cleaner,
Otr /Case Disinfectant Cleaner 12/cs (12x19 Oz) BETCO-GLYBET
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Florencie U. Patton, Principal Buyer BID TABULATION
Phone: (205) 714-3747
Email: underwoodf@jccal.org ITB 70-20

Harriett Bell, Buyer
Phone: (205) 325-8702
Email: bellh@jccal.org

JANITORIAL AND SPECIALTY PRODUCTS

B. End BAC Il Disinfectant Deodorant Spray, BETCO-TB Plus #BET 09423 or approved equal. Tuberculocidal, prevents mold and mildew, kills staph, strep, athlete’s foot fungus and other surface germs.
Disinfects on most environmental surfaces. Fragrance: Fresh pleasant or citrus bouquet.

1 2 3 4
BUDGET JANITORIAL GREEN VISION &
GBMS3, INC. SUPPLY INC. ASSOCIATES, LLC AMERICAN OSMENT
QTY UOoM PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT.PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE
300 CS $ 25.001 $ 7,500.00| $ 24.96| $ 7.488.00| $ 5358 $ 16,074.00({ $ 41.00{ $ 12,300.00| $ 52.05($ 15615.00] $ 90.00] $ 27,000.00

Essential Industries, Neutral

End BAC Il Disinfectant

Betcha 09323-4104 12/17
Oz./Case

Spartan Steriphene

ITWPERMATEX & #26832 Disinfectant Spray

Manufacturer Name & Product Number Germicidal CIn, ESS-702 DN; Diversey End Bac Il #04832 | Deodorant Spray, BETCO-

4/1 Gal Case B
C. Sanibelt disinfectant spray, sanitizer, deodorizer, BETCO Sanibelt #BET-30504 or approved equal. Highly concentrated quaternary. Effective against broad spectrum of pathogenic bacteria.
1 2 3 4 5 6
BUDGET JANITORIAL GREEN VISION &
GBMS, INC. SUPPLY INC. ASSOCIATES, LLC AMERICAN OSMENT
QTY UOM PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT.PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE
400 CS $ 14.00( $ 5,600.00| $ 43.92]| $ 17,568.00| $ 4996| $ 19,984.00($ 37.25( $ 14,900.00| $ 6295 $% 25180.00/ $ 75.00] $ 30,000.00

Manufacturer Name & Product Number

ULINE & # S-19373

Betcha 30504 1:512 Dilution

Essential Industries, Quat
Rinse, ESS-2331 FS; 4/1 Gal.

Spartan Sparsa Q Dis.
Deoderant 12/cs

Diversey Envy Liquid
Disinfectant #04528 (12 x 32
0z.)
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Florencie U. Patton, Principal Buyer
Phone: (205) 714-3747

Email: underwoodf@jccal.org
Harriett Bell, Buyer

Phone: (205) 325-8702

Email: bellh@jccal.org

BID TABULATION
ITB 70-20
JANITORIAL AND SPECIALTY PRODUCTS

D. Urinal Screen, BETCO #BET2507272 or approved equal. Flexible, deluxe vinyl. Mold to shape of urinal.

1 2 3 4
BUDGET JANITORIAL GREEN VISION &
GBMS3, INC. SUPPLY INC. ASSOCIATES, LLC AMERICAN OSMENT
QTY UOoM PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT.PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE
150 BOXES $ 23.00] $ 3450.00| $ 850 $ 1,275.00| $ 12391 $ 1,858.50( $ 49.70( $ 7,455.00 | $ 8.00( $ 1,200.00( $ 100.00) $ 15,000.00

Manufacturer Name & Product Number

ULINE & # S-8127

Hosbet 2507272 12 per Case

Hospeco #03901; 12 ea.

Impact 1451-50 *50 per

Hospeco #03904 (12/Box)

Urinal Screen, BETCO

case*
E. Fresh Products #FRS512-4-CH, Urinal Deodorizer or approved equal.
1 2 3 4
BUDGET JANITORIAL GREEN VISION &
GBMS, INC. SUPPLY INC. ASSOCIATES, LLC AMERICAN OSMENT

QTY UoOM PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT.PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE

320 CS $ 11.00({ $ 3,520.00] $ 748|$ 2,39360| $ 10.92( $ 3,494.40|$ 850] $ 2,720.00( $ 72.00( $ 23,040.00] $ 80.00] $ 25,600.00
Manufacturer Name & Product Number ULINE & # S-1829 HOS OiézllplerFré,aiiZA-CH Fresh, 4p6-F-20-Bx; 12 Box | Big D 900-Cherry 12/Box | Hospeco #06411 (144/Case) Fresh Produccﬁ FRS512-4-
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Florencie U. Patton, Principal Buyer BID TABULATION

Phone: (205) 714-3747
Email: underwoodf@jccal.org ITB 70-20

Harriett Bell, Buyer JANITORIAL AND SPECIALTY PRODUCTS

Phone: (205) 325-8702
Email: bellh@jccal.org

F. General Purpose Disinfectant Cleaner, BETCO #BET-311655 or approved equal. High powdered disinfectant cleaner. Can be used as a sanitizer at 1:64. Gentle enough for all washable solutions.

1 2 3 4 5 6
GBMsINC, | PUPSETIANITORIAL | GREENVISION& | ,\ycqican osMENT
QTY UOM PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT.PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE
40 DRUMS $ 549.00( $ 21,960.00| $ 280.00( $ 11,200.00| $ 586.00( $ 23,440.00| $574.00| $ 22,960.00|] $ 1,221.00| $ 48,840.00| $ 675.00( $ 27,000.00
e e & produmber | SSHNEMACKER, |ty s 6 n| SRS Qi 4| S kOBt  ivey O T8 errd e it

G. Germicidal Cleaner, BETCO, AF315 #BET-31504 or approved equal. Broad Spectrum-disinfection kills Pseudomonas, Salmonella, and Staph, reduces risk of cross contamination. Use recommended in all public places and bacterial
are vital. Fragrance: Citrus Bouquet

2 1 3 4 5 6
BUDGET JANITORIAL GREEN VISION &
Sl lINe: SUPPLY INC. ASSOCIATES, LLC e
QTY UOM PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT.PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE
400 CS $ 22.00( $ 8,800.00| $ 29.04 $ 11,616.00| $ 5358| $ 21,43200($ 30.60| $ 12,240.00( $ 4765| $ 19,060.00] $ 100.00| $ 40,000.00
Essential Industries, Neutral . .
Manufacturer Name & Product Number SUNSHHI\II\IIE CMACKER’ Betco AF315-31504 Germicidal Cln, Ess-702DM; Spartan Xeffect 4/1 gal. D'V;E%Sgé\ég 8 BETCOé’i‘gng #BET-

4/1 Gal CS
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Florencie U. Patton, Principal Buyer
Phone: (205) 714-3747

Email: underwoodf@jccal.org
Harriett Bell, Buyer

Phone: (205) 325-8702

Email: bellh@jccal.org

BID TABULATION
ITB 70-20
JANITORIAL AND SPECIALTY PRODUCTS

H. Odor counteracts Garden fresh AirWorks 6/case or approved equal. Mfg. #AWPA232 (Dispenser should be at no cost).

1 2 3 4 5 6
BUDGET JANITORIAL GREEN VISION &
GBMS, INC. SUPPLY INC. ASSOCIATES, LLc | AMERICAN OSMENT
QTY UOM PRICE |EXT.PRICE| PRICE |EXT.PRICE| PRICE | EXT.PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE
50 cs $ 7300 5 365000] $ _ 4260] $ 2,130.00] $ _ 7800] $  3,90000]| $ 47.27] $  2.36350] $ _ 39.15| $ _ 1057.50] $ 100.00] $ _ 5,000.00
RUBBERMAID .
Manufacturer Name & Product Number COMMERCIAL Airworks AWPA232 Gar';g;pa?s' fg;g;‘;',igsé‘ase A'”"’O';k\f\;gi';d;; Fresh | Hospeco Airworks AWPA232 AWPA232
PRODUCTS LLC $ #289141  110Sp '
GROUP 111 TOTAL Purchasing Totals| $ 56,230.00| $ 65,610.60] $ 102422.90] $ 90,43850| $ 15821750 $ 209,600.00
(ITEMS A-H) Bidder's Totals| $ 57,680.00| $ 65,610.60| $ 102,422.90| $ 90,43850| $ 15821750 $ 209,600.00

A. Glance Glass Cleaner concentrated general purpose and multi surface #4701 or approved equal. General purpose glass and multi surface cleaner cuts grease marks, smoke films, insect residue, soap films. Leaves glass and many
washable surfaces clean without depositing a residue. pH (concentrate): 12.5, Dilution: Ration of 1-10, % Phosphates: None, Storage Stability: 24 months, Deleterious Action: Not recommended for use on copper or brass. Packaged: 6/32

0z.
1 2 3 Z
BUDGET JANITORIAL GREEN VISION &
GBMS, INC. SUPPLY INC. ASSOCIATES, LLC AMERICAN OSMENT
QTY UOM PRICE |EXT.PRICE| PRICE |EXT.PRICE| PRICE | EXT.PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE
$ 560 $ 1,680.00{ 19.96 (150 | $ 299400 $  40.80| $ 12,240.00($ 24.00[ $ 7,20000[ $  21.95| $ 658500 $ 7500 $ 22,500.00
300 cS CS; 12/CS)

Manufacturer Name & Product Number

S.C. JOHNSON & SON,
INC.

Glance Clear Image Pk.
12/32 Oz.

Diversey, Glana Glass CIn RJ-
04705; 6/32 Oz.

Glance NA Glass Cleaner
100975198; 12/32 oz. per

case

Diversey Glance HC #4705;
12 x 32 oz.
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Florencie U. Patton, Principal Buyer
Phone: (205) 714-3747

Email: underwoodf@jccal.org
Harriett Bell, Buyer

Phone: (205) 325-8702

Email: bellh@jccal.org

BID TABULATION
ITB 70-20
JANITORIAL AND SPECIALTY PRODUCTS

B. General Purpose cleaner and polish combination, Aerosol Shine-Up #4441 or approved equal. General purpose cleaners and polish combinations for maintaining furniture and equipment. Free flowing liquid leaves a uniform gloss.
Clean and produce a uniform, streak-free gloss. Leaves a dry, non-oily, protective film on surface not smeary or easily finger marked. Can be used on light or dark furniture, plastic counters and tabletops, leather, chrome, stainless steel, brass,
porcelain, ceramic, marble, enameled surfaces and plastic upholstering. Does not have an objectionable odor or develop an objectionable odor on the surfaces when used. Stability: No spearing, gelling, skin formation or depositing of the

wax. pH: 8.2-8.6, Packaged: 12/15 oz.

1 2 3 4 5 6
BUDGET JANITORIAL GREEN VISION &
GBMS, INC. SUPPLY INC. ASSOCIATES, LLC AMERICAN OSMENT
QTY UOM PRICE |EXT.PRICE| PRICE |EXT.PRICE| PRICE | EXT.PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE
$ 700 $ 1,400.00{ 32.88(100 [ $ 3028800 % 6228 $ 12,456.00($ 3327 $ 665400 $ 3650| $  7,300.00[ $ 75.00{ $ 15,000.00
200 cs CS; 12/32
0Z.)

Manufacturer Name & Product Number

S.C. JOHNSON & SON,
INC. & #350000027092

Betco MSP Shineup

Clare Mfg. Citra Glossal
Surface Duster & Polish; 12/c

18 oz.

Spartan Citro Sheild
Furniture Polish 12/cs

Diversey Shine Up
#14995480; 12 x 32 oz.

Aerosol Shine-Up #4441

C. All Purpose Ammoniated Glass Cleaner, 32 oz. bottle, ABC #CI78Q or approved equal. Physical data: Boiling Point: 200° F, Vapor Density (AIR=1): Unknown, pH: 10.0-11.0, Evaporation Rate (but.ace. 1): < 1, Physical Stat:
Liquid, Appearance and Odor: Clear, yellow, ammonia cal, lemon scented odor, Vapor Pressure: Unknown, Solubility in Water: complete, Specific Gravity (H<O=1): 0.99, Percent solid by weight: 0.1-4.0, Fire and Explosive Hazard Data
Flash Point: 111° Flammable Limits: N/A, Extinguishing Media: Water, Special Fire Fighting Procedures: N/A, Unusual Fire and Explosive Hazards: N/A, Method Used: ASTM-D56, Flame Extensions: N/A.

INC. & #350000014153

Window C1 Ess-103 GC

3261-03; 32 oz bottle

1 2 3 4 5 6
BUDGET JANITORIAL GREEN VISION &
GBMS, INC. SUPPLY INC. ASSOCIATES, LLC AMERICAN OSMENT
QTY UoM PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE
50 BOTTLES $ 560| $ 280.00| $ 154 $ 77.00( $ 245] $ 122501 $ 2.00| $ 100.00| $ -1 8 -1 $ 189.00| $ 9,450.00
Manufacturer Name & Product Number S.C. JOHNSON & SON, ABC Deep Blue C178Q Essential Industries, Blue Spartan Glass Cleaner NO BID Chemical Guys
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Florencie U. Patton, Principal Buyer BID TABULATION

Phone: (205) 714-3747

Email: underwoodf@jccal.org ITB 70-20

Harriett Bell, Buyer JANITORIAL AND SPECIALTY PRODUCTS
Phone: (205) 325-8702

Email: bellh@jccal.org

D. Jell Soap - No wax, no sealer, K-Chem #CLO1C Jell soap or approved equal. High-efficiency, all-purpose cleaner. Recommended for cleaning hard floors, ceramic, tile, marble, mosaic, terrazzo, slate and concrete. Dissolves quickly,
low foaming qualities, highly effective when used in automatic floor scrubbing machines. Penetrates grease, wax and dirt.

1 2 3 4 5 6
BUDGET JANITORIAL GREEN VISION &
GBMS, INC. SUPPLY INC. ASSOCIATES, LLC AMERICAN OSMENT
QTY UoM PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT.PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE
200 PAILS $ 13.00] $ 2,600.00| $ 37.65| $ 7,530.00( $ -1 $ -1 $ -1 $ -1 8 -1 $ -]1$ 57.00] $ 11,400.00
ULINE & #S-18230, S- Harvard Pine Gel 5 Gallon Jell Soap-No Wax, No

Manufacturer Name & Product Number 10492, 5-18233 Container NO BID NO BID NO BID Dealer KEMX
E. Degreaser, aqueous, 30 oz. trigger bottles - Cleaner/Degreaser, aqueous, CRC #14418 or approved equal. Concentrated can be sued full strength or diluted low foaming solvent-based degreaser, biodegradable, non-abrasive, non-
flammable, aqueous cleaner. Safe of most plastics, 30 oz. trigger bottle.

1 2 3 4
BUDGET JANITORIAL GREEN VISION &
SehiEplNe: SUPPLY INC. ASSOCIATES, LLC AMERICAN OSMENT
QTY UOM PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT.PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE
320 CS $ 450 $ 1,440.00| $ 25200 $ 8,064.00| $ 6240 $ 19,968.00| $ 27.50| $ 8,800.00 $ -|$ 199.00| $ 63,680.00
Harvard 14418 Citrus Tough| Etowah Chemical, GS-125, Etc Spartan Tough Duty
Manufacturer Name & Product Number ULINE & #S-20691 12/32 Oz, 1377-Ot.: 12 it Jcase Degreaser 12/32 oz. NO BID CRC #14418
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Florencie U. Patton, Principal Buyer BID TABULATION
Phone: (205) 714-3747
Email: underwoodf@jccal.org ITB 70-20

Harriett Bell, Buyer
Phone: (205) 325-8702
Email: bellh@jccal.org

JANITORIAL AND SPECIALTY PRODUCTS

F. Degreaser, pressure/wash/steam clean, K-Chem #DG47D5 or approved equal. USDA Classification: A4, Color: Clear, blue, Odor: Slight, butyl, Appearance: Clear, thin water-based liquid, pH: 13.

1 2 3 4 5 6
BUDGET JANITORIAL GREEN VISION &
GBMS, INC. SUPPLY INC. ASSOCIATES, LLC AMERICAN OSMENT
QTY UoM PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE | PRICE | EXT.PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE
60 DRUMS $ 549.00| $ 32,940.00| $ 240.00| $ 14,400.00| $ 268.00| $ 16,080.00| $220.00( $ 13,200.00| $ 77260| $ 46,356.00| $ 1,885.00| $ 113,100.00
SUNSHINE MAKERS, INC Etowah Chemical, GS-125, Etc Diversey Tempest SC
Manufacturer Name & Product Number & 013318000027 Harvard Blast It DG47D5 1377-55.; 12 qt Jcase 7-11 Degreaser 251002000 4100986240 K-Chem DG47D5
Purchasing Totals| $ 40,340.00| $ 36,353.00( $ 60,866.50 | $ 35,954.00( $ 60,241.00 | $ 235,130.00
GROUP IV TOTAL
(ITEMS A-F) .
Bidder's Totals| $ 36,980.00( $ 36,353.00( $ 36,048.00| $ 35,954.00( $ 57,241.00| $ 235,130.00
Exact Transportation Charges, if any $ -1 % 2,073.86| $ -1 $ -9 2,000.00
GRAND TOTAL FOR Purchasing Totals| $ 169,260.00( $ 208,171.60| $ 232,204.80| $ 261,585.70( $ 350,115.00| $ 664,730.00
GROUPS I-1V,
INCLUDING
gm';SéPEOsRTAT'ON Bidder's Totals| $ 170,850.00| $ 206,797.10| $ 200,460.16 | $ 254,846.70| $ 347.115.00( 3 666,760.00
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Florencie U. Patton, Principal Buyer BID TABULATION
Phone: (205) 714-3747
Email: underwoodf@jccal.org ITB 70-20

Harriett Bell, Buyer
Phone: (205) 325-8702
Email: bellh@jccal.org

JANITORIAL AND SPECIALTY PRODUCTS

GROUP | - DISCOUNT OFF ON FULL-LINE
CATALOG % $

GROUP 11 - DISCOUNT OFF ON FULL-
LINE CATALOG % $

GROUP 111 - DISCOUNT OFF ON FULL-
LINE CATALOG % $
GROUP IV - DISCOUNT OFF ON FULL-
LINE CATALOG % $
Guaranteed Maximum Discount if Contract is
renewed for 2nd year. 1.0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%
Guaranteed Maximum Discount if Contract is
renewed for 3rd year. 1.5% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%

49,589.00 25% 0% 0% 20%| $ 113,000.00

22,374.00 25% 0% 0% 20%| $ 107,000.00

57,103.00 25% 0% 0% 20%| $ 209,630.00

36,610.00 25% 0% 0% 20%| $ 235,130.00

Award of All Items: Indicate any additional
discount for award of all items to your company:

%. 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%

Payment Discount: Discount for payment of
invoice within 20 days of receiptis __ %.
Payment discounts of 20 or more days will be
considered in award of bid. The County will not
take discounts that are not earned. 0% 1.0% 0% 0% 0% 1.0%

All or Non Offer: This bid is offered on an all
or non basis? (Yes or No) No No No No No No

Maximum Completion or Delivery Time:

Days from receipt of order or notice to proceed.
30 5 7-10 2 10-14 30

Delivery is Guaranteed Not Later Than Days

After Order Date.

7

7

2 10-14 30

Delivery Will be Made by What Method of
Tranporation?

Bidder's Truck Or
Commercial Truck

Bidder's Truck

Bidder's Truck

Bidder's Truck

Bidder's Truck

Bidder's Truck, Sea or Air
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Florencie U. Patton, Principal Buyer
Phone: (205) 714-3747

Email: underwoodf@jccal.org
Harriett Bell, Buyer

Phone: (205) 325-8702

Email: bellh@jccal.org

BID TABULATION
ITB 70-20

JANITORIAL AND SPECIALTY PRODUCTS

REQUIRED FORMS

Notification of Intent to Respond YES YES NO NO YES YES
Non-Collustion Affidavit YES YES YES YES YES YES
Affidavit of Contractor YES YES YES YES YES YES
Jefferson County, Alabama Equal Employment

Opportunity Certification Form YES YES YES YES YES YES
Debarment Statement YES YES YES YES YES YES
Statement of Compliance With Alabama Code Section

31-13-9 YES YES YES YES YES YES
Signature Page YES YES YES YES YES YES
Price Sheet YES YES YES YES YES YES
Addendum | NO YES NO NO YES NO
Bid Bond (If Applicable-Not Applicable if bid is NO-N/A NO-N/A NO-N/A NO-N/A NO-N/A NO-N/A
PACA Form YES-No Signature YES NO YES YES YES
Jefferson County Business License NO NO NO NO NO NO
Certificate of Insurance NO NO NO NO NO NO

CONTACT INFORMATION

1. VENDOR: GBMS, Inc. | ADDRESS: 1917 Duval Street, Mobile, AL 36606 | CONTACT: Gregory B. Morris, Sr., President | PHONE: (251) 473-9575 | TOLL FREE PHONE: N/A | FAX: (251) 473-957 5| EMAIL:
Diphair@aol.com

2. VENDOR: Budget Janitorial Supply | ADDRESS: 90 Pardue Road/P.O. Box 1846, Pelham, AL 35124 | CONTACT: Steven L. Savage, President | PHONE: (205) 663-1822 | TOLL FREE PHONE: (205) 663-1822 | FAX: 205-
663-2088 | EMAIL: ssavage@bjsupply.com

3. VENDOR: Green Vision & Associates, LLC | ADDRESS: 2300 Gerald Jean Street, Gadsden, AL 35901 | CONTACT: Lorice Jackson, VP, Operations | PHONE: (205) 243-0123 | TOLL FREE PHONE: N/A | FAX: N/A
|EMAIL: iicor57jackson@outlook.com

4. VENDOR: American Osment | ADDRESS: 2923 5th Avenue South, Birmingham, AL 35233 | CONTACT: Stan Burt, Sales | PHONE: (205) 326-3456 | TOLL FREE PHONE: N/A | FAX: (205) 325-8134 |[EMAIL:
sburt@imperialdade.com

5. VENDOR: Central Paper Company | ADDRESS: 140 West Oxmoor Road, Birmingham, AL 35209 | CONTACT: Erick Petterson, Vice President | PHONE: (205) 942-6333 | TOLL FREE PHONE: 1-800-854-0619 | FAX: (205)-
941-2070 |EMAIL: epetterson@centralpaper-al.com

6. VENDOR: Malor & Company | ADDRESS: 667 Madison Avenue, 5th Floor, New York, NY 10065 | CONTACT: Garly Benoit, CEO | PHONE: (212) 498-9732 | TOLL FREE PHONE: N/A | FAX: N/A |[EMAIL:
garly.b@malorcompany.com

**Green Vision & Associates - Exact Transportation Charges, if any: Negotiable or $35 under 50 miles; $50 for deliveries over 50 miles from Birmingham.
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